
CARMEL CLAY MUNICIPAL BUILDING CORPORATION BIDS RECEIVED AT:  

PROJECT/CONSTRUCTION MANAGER:   Envoy, Inc.

CARMEL CLAY FIRE STATIONS #43 AND #44 10701 North College Avenue

ARCHITECT: Axis Architecture + Interiors Indianapolis, Inidana 46280

BID TABULATION BID DATE:  Tuesday, June 23, 2015

BID PACKAGE NO 01.1 Sitework & General 44: BIDS DUE:  2:00 p.m.

BIDS READ:  Immediately Following

1

Contractor Name:  JBM Contractors Corporation Myers Construction Management, Inc. Myers Construction Management, Inc. Myers Construction Management, Inc.

Phone:  317.344.2732 317.773.3590 317.773.3590 317.773.3590

Email: 
kcochrum@jbmcontractorscorp.com chad@myerscm.com chad@myerscm.com chad@myerscm.com

Fax:  317.344.2735 317.773.3591 317.773.3591 317.773.3591

Suppl. Bid Proposal Form - Sec 004200
X X X X

Addenda Acknowledged (1-3)
X X X X

Domestic Steel Cert. (attached to Suppl. Bid Form)
X X X X

Form 96 (Revised 2005)
X X X X

Non-Collusion Affidavit - Sec 004519
X X X X

AIA 305 Contractor Qualification
X X X X

Financial Statement
X X X X

Bid Bond 
X X X X

Cert. Good Stdg. (Out of State Only) N/A N/A N/A N/A

Subs & Materials List - Sec 004336
X X X X

BASE BID  
1,386,000$                                                                              1,440,000$                                                                                                             1,440,000$                                                                              1,440,000$                                                                              

(List Alternates, if any)

Alt. #1 Fitness Expansion Addition at Station #43 N/B 14000 (Combo Bid #1) 17000 (Combo Bid #2) 32000 (Combo Bid #3) -$                                                                                               

Alt. #2 Fire Protection Sprinkler System at Station #43 N/B -$                                                                                               

TOTAL INCLUDING ALTERNATES  1,386,000$                                                                              1,440,000$                                                                                                             1,440,000$                                                                              1,440,000$                                                                              -$                                                                                               

COMBINED BIDS  : $1,764,000 (01.1 and 01.2) $2,358,000 $2,470,000 (1.1, 1.2, 4.1, 8.1, 9.3, 9.4, 9.5 and 9.6)
$3,340,000 (1.1, 1.2, 4.1, 5.1, 8.1, 9.1, 9.2, 9.3, 9.4, 9.5, 

9.6)

  (1.1, 1.2, 4.1 and 8.1) 

$2,470,000
 (1.1, 1.2, 4.1, 8.1, 9.3, 9.4, 9.5 and 9.6)

$3,340,000
 (1.1, 1.2, 4.1, 5.1, 8.1, 9.1, 9.2, 9.3, 9.4, 9.5, 9.6)

N/A = NOT APPLICABLE N/B = NO BID

John W. Hensel Government Center

UPDATED 6/30/2015 ENVOY, INC.

mailto:kcochrum@jbmcontractorscorp.com
mailto:chad@myerscm.com
mailto:chad@myerscm.com
mailto:chad@myerscm.com


BIDS RECEIVED AT:  

PROJECT/CONSTRUCTION MANAGER:   Envoy, Inc.

10701 North College Avenue

ARCHITECT: Axis Architecture + Interiors Indianapolis, Inidana 46280

BID DATE:  Tuesday, June 23, 2015

BID PACKAGE NO 01.2 - Sitework & General #43: BIDS DUE:  2:00 p.m.

BIDS READ:  Immediately Following

1

Contractor Name:  JBM Contractors Corporation Myers Construction Management, Inc. Myers Construction Management, Inc. Myers Construction Management, Inc.

Phone:  317.344.2732 317.773.3590 317.773.3590 317.773.3590

Email: 
kcochrum@jbmcontractorscorp.com chad@myerscm.com chad@myerscm.com chad@myerscm.com

Fax:  317.344.2735 317.773.3591 317.773.3591 317.773.3591

Suppl. Bid Proposal Form - Sec 004200 X X X X

Addenda Acknowledged (1-3) X X X X

Domestic Steel Cert. (attached to Suppl. Bid Form) X X X X

Form 96 (Revised 2005) X X X X

Non-Collusion Affidavit - Sec 004519 X X X X

AIA 305 Contractor Qualification X X X X

Financial Statement X X X X

Bid Bond X X X X

Cert. Good Stdg. (Out of State Only) N/A N/A N/A N/A

Subs & Materials List - Sec 004336 X X X X

BASE BID  
408,000$                                                                                    495,000$                                                                                    495,000$                                                                                    495,000$                                                                                    

(List Alternates, if any)

Alt. #1 Fitness Expansion Addition at Station #43 42,000$                                                                                      45,000$                                                                                      45,000$                                                                                      45,000$                                                                                      

Alt. #2 Fire Protection Sprinkler System at Station #43 N/B

TOTAL INCLUDING ALTERNATES  450,000$                                                                                    540,000$                                                                                    540,000$                                                                                    540,000$                                                                                    -$                                                                                                 

COMBINED BIDS  : $1,764,000 (01.1 and 01.2)  $2,358,000 (1.1, 1.2, 4.1 and 8.1) $2,470,000 (1.1, 1.2, 4.1, 8.1, 9.3, 9.4, 9.5 and 9.6)
$3,340,000 (1.1, 1.2, 4.1, 5.1, 8.1, 9.1, 9.2, 9.3, 9.4, 9.5, 

9.6)

N/A = NOT APPLICABLE N/B = NO BID N/C = NO CHANGE

CARMEL CLAY MUNICIPAL BUILDING CORPORATION

John W. Hensel Government Center

CARMEL CLAY FIRE STATIONS #43 AND #44

BID TABULATION

UPDATED 6/30/2015 ENVOY, INC.

mailto:kcochrum@jbmcontractorscorp.com
mailto:chad@myerscm.com
mailto:chad@myerscm.com
mailto:chad@myerscm.com


BIDS RECEIVED AT:  

PROJECT/CONSTRUCTION MANAGER:   Envoy, Inc.

10701 North College Avenue

ARCHITECT: Axis Architecture + Interiors Indianapolis, Inidana 46280

BID DATE:  Tuesday, June 23, 2015

BID PACKAGE NO 04.1 MASONRY #43 AND #44: BIDS DUE:  2:00 p.m.

BIDS READ:  Immediately Following

2 2 2 1

Contractor Name:  Myers Construction Management, Inc. Myers Construction Management, Inc. Myers Construction Management, Inc. Purdy Masonry, Inc.

Phone:  317.773.3590 317.773.3590 317.773.3590 317.769.4673

Email: chad@myerscm.com chad@myerscm.com chad@myerscm.com seanpurdy@tds.net

Fax:  317.773.3591 317.773.3591 317.773.3591 317.769.4693

Suppl. Bid Proposal Form - Sec 004200 X X X X

Addenda Acknowledged (1-3) X X X X

Domestic Steel Cert. (attached to Suppl. Bid Form) X X X X

Form 96 (Revised 2005) X X X X

Non-Collusion Affidavit - Sec 004519 X X X X

AIA 305 Contractor Qualification X X X X

Financial Statement X X X X

Bid Bond X X X X

Cert. Good Stdg. (Out of State Only) N/A N/A N/A N/A

Subs & Materials List - Sec 004336 X X X X

BASE BID  
750,000$                                                                                    750,000$                                                                                    750,000$                                                                                    529,500$                                                                                    x

(List Alternates, if any)

Alt. #1 Fitness Expansion Addition at Station #43 10,000$                                                                                      

Alt. #2 Fire Protection Sprinkler System at Station #43 N/B

TOTAL INCLUDING ALTERNATES  750,000$                                                                                    750,000$                                                                                    750,000$                                                                                    539,500$                                                                                    -$                                                                                                 

COMBINED BIDS  :  $2,358,000 (1.1, 1.2, 4.1 and 8.1) $2,470,000 (1.1, 1.2, 4.1, 8.1, 9.3, 9.4, 9.5 and 9.6)
$3,340,000 (1.1, 1.2, 4.1, 5.1, 8.1, 9.1, 9.2, 9.3, 9.4, 9.5, 

9.6)

N/A = NOT APPLICABLE N/B = NO BID N/C = NO CHANGE

CARMEL CLAY MUNICIPAL BUILDING CORPORATION

John W. Hensel Government Center

CARMEL CLAY FIRE STATIONS #43 AND #44

BID TABULATION

UPDATED 6/30/2015 ENVOY, INC.

mailto:chad@myerscm.com
mailto:chad@myerscm.com
mailto:chad@myerscm.com
mailto:seanpurdy@tds.net


BIDS RECEIVED AT:  

PROJECT/CONSTRUCTION MANAGER:   Envoy, Inc.

10701 North College Avenue

ARCHITECT: Axis Architecture + Interiors Indianapolis, Inidana 46280

BID DATE:  Tuesday, June 23, 2015

BID PACKAGE NO 05.1 STRUCTURAL STEEL #44: BIDS DUE:  2:00 p.m.

BIDS READ:  Immediately Following
3 2 1

Contractor Name:  Myers Construction Management, Inc. Century Steel Fabricating, Inc. Indiana Steel Fabricating, Inc.

Phone:  317.773.3590 317.834.1249 317.247.4545

Email: chad@myerscm.com centurysteel@comcast.net joshr@indianasteelfab.com

Fax:  317.773.3591 317.834.1579 317.241.6223

Suppl. Bid Proposal Form - Sec 004200 X X X

Addenda Acknowledged (1-3) X X X

Domestic Steel Cert. (attached to Suppl. Bid Form) X X X

Form 96 (Revised 2005) X X X

Non-Collusion Affidavit - Sec 004519 X X X

AIA 305 Contractor Qualification X X X

Financial Statement X X X

Bid Bond X X X

Cert. Good Stdg. (Out of State Only) N/A N/A N/A

Subs & Materials List - Sec 004336 X X X

BASE BID  
750,000$                                                                                    614,800$                                                                                    445,000$                                                                                    

(List Alternates, if any)

Alt. #1 Fitness Expansion Addition at Station #43 N/B N/B

Alt. #2 Fire Protection Sprinkler System at Station #43 N/B N/B

TOTAL INCLUDING ALTERNATES  750,000$                                                                                    614,800$                                                                                    445,000$                                                                                    -$                                                                                                 -$                                                                                                 

COMBINED BIDS  :
$3,340,000 (1.1, 1.2, 4.1, 5.1, 8.1, 9.1, 9.2, 9.3, 9.4, 9.5, 

9.6)

N/A = NOT APPLICABLE N/B = NO BID N/C = NO CHANGE
 

CARMEL CLAY MUNICIPAL BUILDING CORPORATION

John W. Hensel Government Center

CARMEL CLAY FIRE STATIONS #43 AND #44

BID TABULATION

UPDATED 6/30/2015 ENVOY, INC.

mailto:chad@myerscm.com
mailto:centurysteel@comcast.net
mailto:joshr@indianasteelfab.com


BIDS RECEIVED AT:  

PROJECT/CONSTRUCTION MANAGER:   Envoy, Inc.

10701 North College Avenue

ARCHITECT: Axis Architecture + Interiors Indianapolis, Inidana 46280

BID DATE:  Tuesday, June 23, 2015

BID PACKAGE NO 07.1 ROOFING #43 AND #44: BIDS DUE:  2:00 p.m.

BIDS READ:  Immediately Following
2 1 3

Contractor Name:  Fredericks Inc. Diversified Roofing Services, LLC
Blackmore & Buckner Roofing, LLC A Tecta America 

Company

Phone:  765.778.7588 317.215.5600 317.263.0707

Email: steve.fredericks@fredericksinc.com mhutchings@diversifiedroofing.us dlarsen@blackmorebuckner.com

Fax:  765.778.7589 317.215.5600 317.263.0727

Suppl. Bid Proposal Form - Sec 004200 X X X

Addenda Acknowledged (1-3) X X X

Domestic Steel Cert. (attached to Suppl. Bid Form) X X X

Form 96 (Revised 2005) X X X

Non-Collusion Affidavit - Sec 004519 X X X

AIA 305 Contractor Qualification X X

Financial Statement X X X

Bid Bond X X X

Cert. Good Stdg. (Out of State Only) N/A N/A N/A

Subs & Materials List - Sec 004336 X X

BASE BID  
157,800$                                                                                    162,120$                                                                                    245,477$                                                                                    

(List Alternates, if any)

Alt. #1 Fitness Expansion Addition at Station #43 8,000$                                                                                        3,540$                                                                                        6,100$                                                                                        

Alt. #2 Fire Protection Sprinkler System at Station #43 N/B N/B N/B

TOTAL INCLUDING ALTERNATES  165,800$                                                                                    165,660$                                                                                    251,577$                                                                                    -$                                                                                                 -$                                                                                                 

COMBINED BIDS  :

N/A = NOT APPLICABLE N/B = NO BID N/C = NO CHANGE
 

CARMEL CLAY MUNICIPAL BUILDING CORPORATION

John W. Hensel Government Center

CARMEL CLAY FIRE STATIONS #43 AND #44

BID TABULATION

UPDATED 6/30/2015 ENVOY, INC.

mailto:steve.fredericks@fredericksinc.com
mailto:mhutchings@diversifiedroofing.us
mailto:dlarsen@blackmorebuckner.com


BIDS RECEIVED AT:  

PROJECT/CONSTRUCTION MANAGER:   Envoy, Inc.

ARCHITECT: Axis Architecture + Interiors

BID DATE:  

BID PACKAGE NO 08.1 GLASS & GLAZING #43 AND #44: BIDS DUE:  

BIDS READ:  
1

Contractor Name:  Myers Construction Management, Inc.

Phone:  317.773.3590

Email: chad@myerscm.com

Fax:  317.773.3591

Suppl. Bid Proposal Form - Sec 004200 X

Addenda Acknowledged (1-3) X

Domestic Steel Cert. (attached to Suppl. Bid Form) X

Form 96 (Revised 2005) X

Non-Collusion Affidavit - Sec 004519 X

AIA 305 Contractor Qualification X

Financial Statement X

Bid Bond X

Cert. Good Stdg. (Out of State Only) N/A

Subs & Materials List - Sec 004336 X

BASE BID  
115,000$                                                                                                        

(List Alternates, if any)

Alt. #1 Fitness Expansion Addition at Station #43

Alt. #2 Fire Protection Sprinkler System at Station #43

TOTAL INCLUDING ALTERNATES  115,000$                                                                                                        -$                                                                                                 -$                                                                                                 -$                                                                                                 

COMBINED BIDS  :  $2,358,000 (1.1, 1.2, 4.1 and 8.1) 

 $2,470,000 (1.1, 1.2, 4.1, 8.1, 9.3, 9.4, 9.5 and 9.6) 

 $3,340,000 (1.1, 1.2, 4.1, 5.1, 8.1, 9.1, 9.2, 9.3, 9.4, 9.5, 9.6) 

N/A = NOT APPLICABLE N/B = NO BID N/C = NO CHANGE

CARMEL CLAY MUNICIPAL BUILDING CORPORATION

CARMEL CLAY FIRE STATIONS #43 AND #44

BID TABULATION

UPDATED 6/30/2015 ENVOY, INC.

mailto:chad@myerscm.com


10701 North College Avenue

Indianapolis, Inidana 46280

Tuesday, June 23, 2015

2:00 p.m.

Immediately Following

-$                                                                                                 

John W. Hensel Government Center

UPDATED 6/30/2015 ENVOY, INC.



BIDS RECEIVED AT:  

PROJECT/CONSTRUCTION MANAGER:   Envoy, Inc.

10701 North College Avenue

ARCHITECT: Axis Architecture + Interiors Indianapolis, Inidana 46280

BID DATE:  Tuesday, June 23, 2015

BID PACKAGE NO 09.1 METAL STUDS/GYPSUM/ACOUSTICAL #44: BIDS DUE:  2:00 p.m.

BIDS READ:  Immediately Following
1

Contractor Name:  Myers Construction Management, Inc.

Phone:  317.773.3590

Email: chad@myerscm.com

Fax:  317.773.3591

Suppl. Bid Proposal Form - Sec 004200 X

Addenda Acknowledged (1-3) X

Domestic Steel Cert. (attached to Suppl. Bid Form) X

Form 96 (Revised 2005) X

Non-Collusion Affidavit - Sec 004519 X

AIA 305 Contractor Qualification X

Financial Statement X

Bid Bond X

Cert. Good Stdg. (Out of State Only) N/A

Subs & Materials List - Sec 004336 X

BASE BID  
500,000$                                                                                    

(List Alternates, if any)

Alt. #1 Fitness Expansion Addition at Station #43

Alt. #2 Fire Protection Sprinkler System at Station #43

TOTAL INCLUDING ALTERNATES  500,000$                                                                                    -$                                                                                                 -$                                                                                                 -$                                                                                                 -$                                                                                                 

COMBINED BIDS  :
$3,340,000 (1.1, 1.2, 4.1, 5.1, 8.1, 9.1, 9.2, 9.3, 9.4, 9.5, 

9.6)

N/A = NOT APPLICABLE N/B = NO BID N/C = NO CHANGE
 

CARMEL CLAY MUNICIPAL BUILDING CORPORATION

John W. Hensel Government Center

CARMEL CLAY FIRE STATIONS #43 AND #44

BID TABULATION

UPDATED 6/30/2015 ENVOY, INC.

mailto:chad@myerscm.com


BIDS RECEIVED AT:  

PROJECT/CONSTRUCTION MANAGER:   Envoy, Inc.

10701 North College Avenue

ARCHITECT: Axis Architecture + Interiors Indianapolis, Inidana 46280

BID DATE:  Tuesday, June 23, 2015

BID PACKAGE NO 09.2 GYPSUM WALL BOARD/ACOUSTICAL #43: BIDS DUE:  2:00 p.m.

BIDS READ:  Immediately Following
1

Contractor Name:  Myers Construction Management, Inc.

Phone:  317.773.3590

Email: chad@myerscm.com

Fax:  317.773.3591

Suppl. Bid Proposal Form - Sec 004200 X

Addenda Acknowledged (1-3) X

Domestic Steel Cert. (attached to Suppl. Bid Form) X

Form 96 (Revised 2005) X

Non-Collusion Affidavit - Sec 004519 X

AIA 305 Contractor Qualification X

Financial Statement X

Bid Bond X

Cert. Good Stdg. (Out of State Only) N/A

Subs & Materials List - Sec 004336 X

BASE BID  
150,000$                                                                                    

(List Alternates, if any)

Alt. #1 Fitness Expansion Addition at Station #43 16,000$                                                                                      

Alt. #2 Fire Protection Sprinkler System at Station #43

TOTAL INCLUDING ALTERNATES  166,000$                                                                                    -$                                                                                                 -$                                                                                                 -$                                                                                                 -$                                                                                                 

COMBINED BIDS  :
$3,340,000 (1.1, 1.2, 4.1, 5.1, 8.1, 9.1, 9.2, 9.3, 9.4, 9.5, 

9.6)

N/A = NOT APPLICABLE N/B = NO BID N/C = NO CHANGE
 

CARMEL CLAY MUNICIPAL BUILDING CORPORATION

John W. Hensel Government Center

CARMEL CLAY FIRE STATIONS #43 AND #44

BID TABULATION

UPDATED 6/30/2015 ENVOY, INC.

mailto:chad@myerscm.com


BIDS RECEIVED AT:  

PROJECT/CONSTRUCTION MANAGER:   Envoy, Inc.

10701 North College Avenue

ARCHITECT: Axis Architecture + Interiors Indianapolis, Inidana 46280

BID DATE:  Tuesday, June 23, 2015

BID PACKAGE NO 09.3 CARPET/RESILIENT FLOOR/TILE #44: BIDS DUE:  2:00 p.m.

BIDS READ:  Immediately Following
2 2 1

Contractor Name:  Myers Construction Management, Inc. Myers Construction Management, Inc. Chance Bros. Marble & Tile, Inc.

Phone:  317.773.3590 317.773.3590 317.635.7531

Email: chad@myerscm.com chad@myerscm.com
tim@chancebrosmarbleandtile.com; tiletyc@gmail.com

Fax:  317.773.3591 317.773.3591 317.636.8976

Suppl. Bid Proposal Form - Sec 004200 X X X

Addenda Acknowledged (1-3) X X X

Domestic Steel Cert. (attached to Suppl. Bid Form) X X X

Form 96 (Revised 2005) X X X

Non-Collusion Affidavit - Sec 004519 X X X

AIA 305 Contractor Qualification X X X

Financial Statement X X X

Bid Bond X X X

Cert. Good Stdg. (Out of State Only) N/A N/A N/A

Subs & Materials List - Sec 004336 X X X

BASE BID  
87,000$                                                                                      87,000$                                                                                      64,650$                                                                                      

(List Alternates, if any)

Alt. #1 Fitness Expansion Addition at Station #43 N/B

Alt. #2 Fire Protection Sprinkler System at Station #43 N/B

TOTAL INCLUDING ALTERNATES  87,000$                                                                                      87,000$                                                                                      64,650$                                                                                      -$                                                                                                 -$                                                                                                 

COMBINED BIDS  : $2,470,000 (1.1, 1.2, 4.1, 8.1, 9.3, 9.4, 9.5 and 9.6)
$3,340,000 (1.1, 1.2, 4.1, 5.1, 8.1, 9.1, 9.2, 9.3, 9.4, 9.5, 

9.6)

N/A = NOT APPLICABLE N/B = NO BID N/C = NO CHANGE
 

CARMEL CLAY MUNICIPAL BUILDING CORPORATION

John W. Hensel Government Center

CARMEL CLAY FIRE STATIONS #43 AND #44

BID TABULATION

UPDATED 6/30/2015 ENVOY, INC.

mailto:chad@myerscm.com
mailto:chad@myerscm.com


BIDS RECEIVED AT:  

PROJECT/CONSTRUCTION MANAGER:   Envoy, Inc.

10701 North College Avenue

ARCHITECT: Axis Architecture + Interiors Indianapolis, Inidana 46280

BID DATE:  Tuesday, June 23, 2015

BID PACKAGE NO 09.4 CARPET/EXERCISE FLOORING/TILE #43: BIDS DUE:  2:00 p.m.

BIDS READ:  Immediately Following
1 2

Contractor Name:  Myers Construction Management, Inc. Chance Bros. Marble & Tile, Inc.

Phone:  317.773.3590 317.635.7531

Email: chad@myerscm.com tim@chancebrosmarbleandtile.com; tiletyc@gmail.com

Fax:  317.773.3591 317.636.8976

Suppl. Bid Proposal Form - Sec 004200 X X

Addenda Acknowledged (1-3) X X

Domestic Steel Cert. (attached to Suppl. Bid Form) X X

Form 96 (Revised 2005) X X

Non-Collusion Affidavit - Sec 004519 X X

AIA 305 Contractor Qualification X X

Financial Statement X X

Bid Bond X X

Cert. Good Stdg. (Out of State Only) N/A N/A

Subs & Materials List - Sec 004336 X X

BASE BID  
12,000$                                                                                                   29,950$                                                                                      

(List Alternates, if any)

Alt. #1 Fitness Expansion Addition at Station #43 2,300$                                                                                                      4,100$                                                                                        

Alt. #2 Fire Protection Sprinkler System at Station #43 N/B

TOTAL INCLUDING ALTERNATES  14,300$                                                                                                   34,050$                                                                                      -$                                                                                                 -$                                                                                                 -$                                                                                                 

COMBINED BIDS  : $2,470,000 (1.1, 1.2, 4.1, 8.1, 9.3, 9.4, 9.5 and 9.6)
$3,340,000 (1.1, 1.2, 4.1, 5.1, 8.1, 9.1, 9.2, 9.3, 9.4, 9.5, 

9.6)

$3,340,000 (1.1, 1.2, 4.1, 5.1, 8.1, 9.1, 9.2, 9.3, 9.4, 9.5, 9.6)

N/A = NOT APPLICABLE N/B = NO BID N/C = NO CHANGE
 

CARMEL CLAY MUNICIPAL BUILDING CORPORATION

John W. Hensel Government Center

CARMEL CLAY FIRE STATIONS #43 AND #44

BID TABULATION

UPDATED 6/30/2015 ENVOY, INC.

mailto:chad@myerscm.com
mailto:chad@myerscm.com


BIDS RECEIVED AT:  

PROJECT/CONSTRUCTION MANAGER:   Envoy, Inc.

10701 North College Avenue

ARCHITECT: Axis Architecture + Interiors Indianapolis, Inidana 46280

BID DATE:  Tuesday, June 23, 2015

BID PACKAGE NO 09.5 PAINTING #44: BIDS DUE:  2:00 p.m.

BIDS READ:  Immediately Following
3 1 2

Contractor Name:  Myers Construction Management, Inc. Anthony Anderson Corp Bill Lawrence Company, Inc.

Phone:  317.773.3590 317.541.8276 317.632.0363

Email: chad@myerscm.com mike@anthonyandersoncorp.com rod@blcoinc.com

Fax:  317.773.3591 317.536.2785 317.685.0517

Suppl. Bid Proposal Form - Sec 004200 X X X

Addenda Acknowledged (1-3) X X X

Domestic Steel Cert. (attached to Suppl. Bid Form) X X X

Form 96 (Revised 2005) X X X

Non-Collusion Affidavit - Sec 004519 X X X

AIA 305 Contractor Qualification X X X

Financial Statement X X X

Bid Bond X X X

Cert. Good Stdg. (Out of State Only) N/A N/A N/A

Subs & Materials List - Sec 004336 X X X

BASE BID  
60,000$                                                                                                  38,600$                                                                                      41,700$                                                                                      

(List Alternates, if any)

Alt. #1 Fitness Expansion Addition at Station #43 N/B 800$                                                                                           

Alt. #2 Fire Protection Sprinkler System at Station #43 N/B N/B

TOTAL INCLUDING ALTERNATES  60,000$                                                                                                  38,600$                                                                                      42,500$                                                                                      -$                                                                                                 -$                                                                                                 

COMBINED BIDS  : $2,470,000 (1.1, 1.2, 4.1, 8.1, 9.3, 9.4, 9.5 and 9.6)

$3,340,000 (1.1, 1.2, 4.1, 5.1, 8.1, 9.1, 9.2, 9.3, 9.4, 9.5, 9.6)

N/A = NOT APPLICABLE N/B = NO BID N/C = NO CHANGE
 

CARMEL CLAY MUNICIPAL BUILDING CORPORATION

John W. Hensel Government Center

CARMEL CLAY FIRE STATIONS #43 AND #44

BID TABULATION

UPDATED 6/30/2015 ENVOY, INC.

mailto:chad@myerscm.com
mailto:chad@myerscm.com
mailto:mike@anthonyandersoncorp.com


BIDS RECEIVED AT:  

PROJECT/CONSTRUCTION MANAGER:   Envoy, Inc.

10701 North College Avenue

ARCHITECT: Axis Architecture + Interiors Indianapolis, Inidana 46280

BID DATE:  Tuesday, June 23, 2015

BID PACKAGE NO 09.6 PAINTING #43: BIDS DUE:  2:00 p.m.

BIDS READ:  Immediately Following
3 1 2

Contractor Name:  Myers Construction Management, Inc. Anthony Anderson Corp Bill Lawrence Company, Inc.

Phone:  317.773.3590 317.541.8276 317.632.0363

Email: chad@myerscm.com mike@anthonyandersoncorp.com rod@blcoinc.com

Fax:  317.773.3591 317.536.2785 317.685.0517

Suppl. Bid Proposal Form - Sec 004200 X X X

Addenda Acknowledged (1-3) X X X

Domestic Steel Cert. (attached to Suppl. Bid Form) X X X

Form 96 (Revised 2005) X X X

Non-Collusion Affidavit - Sec 004519 X X X

AIA 305 Contractor Qualification X X X

Financial Statement X X X

Bid Bond X X X

Cert. Good Stdg. (Out of State Only) N/A N/A N/A

Subs & Materials List - Sec 004336 X X X

BASE BID  
19,000$                                                                                                  14,800$                                                                                      16,300$                                                                                      

(List Alternates, if any)

Alt. #1 Fitness Expansion Addition at Station #43 1,000$                                                                                                    1,600$                                                                                        800$                                                                                           

Alt. #2 Fire Protection Sprinkler System at Station #43 N/B N/B

TOTAL INCLUDING ALTERNATES  20,000$                                                                                                  16,400$                                                                                      17,100$                                                                                      -$                                                                                                 -$                                                                                                 

COMBINED BIDS  : $2,470,000 (1.1, 1.2, 4.1, 8.1, 9.3, 9.4, 9.5 and 9.6)

$3,340,000 (1.1, 1.2, 4.1, 5.1, 8.1, 9.1, 9.2, 9.3, 9.4, 9.5, 9.6)

N/A = NOT APPLICABLE N/B = NO BID N/C = NO CHANGE
 

CARMEL CLAY MUNICIPAL BUILDING CORPORATION

John W. Hensel Government Center

CARMEL CLAY FIRE STATIONS #43 AND #44

BID TABULATION

UPDATED 6/30/2015 ENVOY, INC.

mailto:chad@myerscm.com
mailto:chad@myerscm.com
mailto:mike@anthonyandersoncorp.com


BIDS RECEIVED AT:  

PROJECT/CONSTRUCTION MANAGER:   Envoy, Inc.

10701 North College Avenue

ARCHITECT: Axis Architecture + Interiors Indianapolis, Inidana 46280

BID DATE:  Tuesday, June 23, 2015

BID PACKAGE NO 21.1 FIRE PROTECTION #43 and #44: BIDS DUE:  2:00 p.m.

BIDS READ:  Immediately Following
3 1 2

Contractor Name:  Dalmatian Fire, Inc. Integrity Fire Protection, LLC Ryan Fireprotection, Inc.

Phone:  317.299.3889 317.361.9770 317.770.7100

Email: dwhitman@dalmatianfire.net john@integrityfirellc.com ryan@ryanfp.com

Fax:  317.299.4078 N/A 317.770.0100

Suppl. Bid Proposal Form - Sec 004200 X X X

Addenda Acknowledged (1-3) X X X

Domestic Steel Cert. (attached to Suppl. Bid Form) X X X

Form 96 (Revised 2005) X X X

Non-Collusion Affidavit - Sec 004519 X X

AIA 305 Contractor Qualification X X X

Financial Statement X X X

Bid Bond X X X

Cert. Good Stdg. (Out of State Only) N/A N/A N/A

Subs & Materials List - Sec 004336 X X

BASE BID  
130,000$                                                                                    73,380$                                                                                      125,420$                                                                                    

(List Alternates, if any)

Alt. #1 Fitness Expansion Addition at Station #43 2,000$                                                                                        1,215$                                                                                        4,280$                                                                                        

Alt. #2 Fire Protection Sprinkler System at Station #43 (70,000)$                                                                                    (17,610)$                                                                                    (56,890)$                                                                                    

TOTAL INCLUDING ALTERNATES  62,000$                                                                                      56,985$                                                                                      72,810$                                                                                      -$                                                                                                 -$                                                                                                 

COMBINED BIDS  :

N/A = NOT APPLICABLE N/B = NO BID N/C = NO CHANGE
 

CARMEL CLAY MUNICIPAL BUILDING CORPORATION

John W. Hensel Government Center

CARMEL CLAY FIRE STATIONS #43 AND #44

BID TABULATION

UPDATED 6/30/2015 ENVOY, INC.

mailto:dwhitman@dalmatianfire.net
mailto:john@integrityfirellc.com
mailto:ryan@ryanfp.com


BIDS RECEIVED AT:  

PROJECT/CONSTRUCTION MANAGER:   Envoy, Inc.

10701 North College Avenue

ARCHITECT: Axis Architecture + Interiors Indianapolis, Inidana 46280

BID DATE:  Tuesday, June 23, 2015

BID PACKAGE NO 23.1 MECHANICAL #44: BIDS DUE:  2:00 p.m.

BIDS READ:  Immediately Following
1

Contractor Name:  
Lehman's Inc. of Anderson d/b/a Lehman's Mechanical 

Contractors, Inc.

Phone:  765.644.4700

Email: efbblehmans@aol.com

Fax:  765.644.6699

Suppl. Bid Proposal Form - Sec 004200 X

Addenda Acknowledged (1-3) X

Domestic Steel Cert. (attached to Suppl. Bid Form) X

Form 96 (Revised 2005) X

Non-Collusion Affidavit - Sec 004519 X

AIA 305 Contractor Qualification X

Financial Statement X

Bid Bond X

Cert. Good Stdg. (Out of State Only) N/A

Subs & Materials List - Sec 004336 X

BASE BID  
503,500$                                                                                    

(List Alternates, if any)

Alt. #1 Fitness Expansion Addition at Station #43 N/A

Alt. #2 Fire Protection Sprinkler System at Station #43 N/B

TOTAL INCLUDING ALTERNATES  503,500$                                                                                    -$                                                                                                 -$                                                                                                 -$                                                                                                 -$                                                                                                 

COMBINED BIDS  : $606,500 (23.1 AND 23.2)

N/A = NOT APPLICABLE N/B = NO BID N/C = NO CHANGE
 

CARMEL CLAY MUNICIPAL BUILDING CORPORATION

John W. Hensel Government Center

CARMEL CLAY FIRE STATIONS #43 AND #44

BID TABULATION

UPDATED 6/30/2015 ENVOY, INC.



BIDS RECEIVED AT:  

PROJECT/CONSTRUCTION MANAGER:   Envoy, Inc.

10701 North College Avenue

ARCHITECT: Axis Architecture + Interiors Indianapolis, Inidana 46280

BID DATE:  Tuesday, June 23, 2015

BID PACKAGE NO 23.2 MECHANICAL #43: BIDS DUE:  2:00 p.m.

BIDS READ:  Immediately Following
1

Contractor Name:  
Lehman's Inc. of Anderson d/b/a Lehman's Mechanical 

Contractors, Inc.

Phone:  765.644.4700

Email: efbblehmans@aol.com

Fax:  765.644.6699

Suppl. Bid Proposal Form - Sec 004200 X

Addenda Acknowledged (1-3) X

Domestic Steel Cert. (attached to Suppl. Bid Form) X

Form 96 (Revised 2005) X

Non-Collusion Affidavit - Sec 004519 X

AIA 305 Contractor Qualification X

Financial Statement X

Bid Bond X

Cert. Good Stdg. (Out of State Only) N/A

Subs & Materials List - Sec 004336 X

BASE BID  
105,000$                                                                                    

(List Alternates, if any)

Alt. #1 Fitness Expansion Addition at Station #43 18,000$                                                                                      

Alt. #2 Fire Protection Sprinkler System at Station #43 N/B

TOTAL INCLUDING ALTERNATES  123,000$                                                                                    -$                                                                                                 -$                                                                                                 -$                                                                                                 -$                                                                                                 

COMBINED BIDS  : $606,500 (23.1 AND 23.2)

N/A = NOT APPLICABLE N/B = NO BID N/C = NO CHANGE
 

CARMEL CLAY MUNICIPAL BUILDING CORPORATION

John W. Hensel Government Center

CARMEL CLAY FIRE STATIONS #43 AND #44

BID TABULATION

UPDATED 6/30/2015 ENVOY, INC.



BIDS RECEIVED AT:  

PROJECT/CONSTRUCTION MANAGER:   Envoy, Inc.

10701 North College Avenue

ARCHITECT: Axis Architecture + Interiors Indianapolis, Inidana 46280

BID DATE:  Tuesday, June 23, 2015

BID PACKAGE NO 26.1 ELECTRICAL #44: BIDS DUE:  2:00 p.m.

BIDS READ:  Immediately Following
1 2

Contractor Name:  Fredericks Inc. James Babcock, Inc. Central Industrial Contractors, Inc.

Phone:  765.778.7588 317.898.1172 765.664.3335

Email: steve.fredericks@fredericksinc.com danb@jamesbabcockinc.com myoung@cicmarion.com

Fax:  765.778.7589 317.898.1185 765.664.2961

Suppl. Bid Proposal Form - Sec 004200 X X X

Addenda Acknowledged (1-3) X X X

Domestic Steel Cert. (attached to Suppl. Bid Form) X X X

Form 96 (Revised 2005) X X X

Non-Collusion Affidavit - Sec 004519 X X X

AIA 305 Contractor Qualification X X X

Financial Statement X X X

Bid Bond X X X

Cert. Good Stdg. (Out of State Only) N/A N/A N/A

Subs & Materials List - Sec 004336 X X

BASE BID  
289,000$                                                                                    404,000$                                                                                    295,560$                                                                                    

(List Alternates, if any)

Alt. #1 Fitness Expansion Addition at Station #43 8,000$                                                                                        N/B N/B

Alt. #2 Fire Protection Sprinkler System at Station #43 N/B N/B N/B

TOTAL INCLUDING ALTERNATES  297,000$                                                                                    404,000$                                                                                    295,560$                                                                                    -$                                                                                                 -$                                                                                                 

COMBINED BIDS  :  $565,000 (26.1 AND 26.2) 

N/A = NOT APPLICABLE N/B = NO BID N/C = NO CHANGE
 

CARMEL CLAY MUNICIPAL BUILDING CORPORATION

John W. Hensel Government Center

CARMEL CLAY FIRE STATIONS #43 AND #44

BID TABULATION

UPDATED 6/30/2015 ENVOY, INC.

mailto:steve.fredericks@fredericksinc.com
mailto:danb@jamesbabcockinc.com
mailto:myoung@cicmarion.com


BIDS RECEIVED AT:  

PROJECT/CONSTRUCTION MANAGER:   Envoy, Inc.

10701 North College Avenue

ARCHITECT: Axis Architecture + Interiors Indianapolis, Inidana 46280

BID DATE:  Tuesday, June 23, 2015

BID PACKAGE NO 26.2 ELECTRICAL #43: BIDS DUE:  2:00 p.m.

BIDS READ:  Immediately Following
1

Contractor Name:  James Babcock, Inc.

Phone:  317.898.1172

Email: danb@jamesbabcockinc.com

Fax:  317.898.1185

Suppl. Bid Proposal Form - Sec 004200 X

Addenda Acknowledged (1-3) X

Domestic Steel Cert. (attached to Suppl. Bid Form) X

Form 96 (Revised 2005) X

Non-Collusion Affidavit - Sec 004519 X

AIA 305 Contractor Qualification X

Financial Statement X

Bid Bond X

Cert. Good Stdg. (Out of State Only) N/A

Subs & Materials List - Sec 004336 X

BASE BID  
164,000$                                                                                    

(List Alternates, if any)

Alt. #1 Fitness Expansion Addition at Station #43 9,300$                                                                                        

Alt. #2 Fire Protection Sprinkler System at Station #43 N/B

TOTAL INCLUDING ALTERNATES  173,300$                                                                                    -$                                                                                                 -$                                                                                                 -$                                                                                                 -$                                                                                                 

COMBINED BIDS  : $565,000 (26.1 AND 26.2)

N/A = NOT APPLICABLE N/B = NO BID N/C = NO CHANGE
 

CARMEL CLAY MUNICIPAL BUILDING CORPORATION

John W. Hensel Government Center

CARMEL CLAY FIRE STATIONS #43 AND #44

BID TABULATION

UPDATED 6/30/2015 ENVOY, INC.

mailto:danb@jamesbabcockinc.com

